
Urban Poverty
A study to understand the contribution of the urban poor to the 

economy and functioning of the city.

Objective

In recent times, there has been a shift in conceptualising poverty in 
an interconnected manner, rather than in a reductive way. If 
poverty is a multidimensional phenomenon, what then is the nature 
of the relationship between poverty, income/wages, and 
well-being? What are the implications of such a conception of 
poverty, income/wages, and well-being for programmes addressing 
poverty? 
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Research on urban poverty

There are four challenges in understanding poverty for 
policymaking: First, traditional approaches to understanding 
poverty either focus on the micro-level or on the macro-level, and 
there is a disjunction between these two approaches. Second, 
capturing the consequences of policies that reflect in the long-term 
and understanding their impact on individuals’ lives is not easy to 
model. Third, the interlinkages between various dimensions of 
poverty and how it changes with time is again not easy to model. 
Fourth, the needs and preferences of people are not included in the 
policymaking process.
 
In order to address these challenges, at Fields of View, we use a 
computational modelling approach, which combines both 
simulations and games. We use agent-based modeling that allows us 
to model micro-level behaviour and integrate it with macro-level 
data. In addition, the computing power available today allows us to 
model interlinkages between different dimensions and examine 
change over a period of time. As the simulation can be run for an 
extended period of time, it is possible to examine long-term 
consequences of policies at both micro-level (individuals’ lives) and 
macro-levels (level of inequality).
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